
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA, COUNTY OF UPSHUR, CITY OF BUCKHANNON, TO WIT: 
 

A regular meeting of the Buckhannon City Council was held on Thursday, June 16, 2022, at 7:00pm 
in the Council Chambers of City Hall.  The following individuals were in attendance (GTM – 
GoToMeeting):  
        
Mayor       Robbie Skinner        Present 
City Recorder      Randy Sanders  Present 
Council Member      Pam Bucklew  Present 
Council Member      Shelia Lewis-Sines Present 
Council Member      Jack Reger  Present 
Council Member      CJ Rylands  Present 
Council Member      David Thomas  Present  
Assistant Recorder & Director of Finance      Amberle Jenkins        Present 
City Attorney      Tom O’Neill  Present 
BPD       Chief Matthew Gregory Present 
Director of Public Works     Jerry Arnold  Present 
Channel 3      Rodney Irvin  Present 
MyBuckhannon.com     Katie Kuba  Present 
MyBuckhannon.com     Beth Broschart  Present 
 
Guests:  Pete Thackston, USI Insurance Services (GTM); Michael Mills, Mills Group; Ron Pugh; Debra 
Brockleman, SYCC; Don Nester, SYCC Board; Dennis Cortes, Upshur County Parks & Recreation 
Board; Dawn Arnold  
 
To participate in a City Council meeting participants were invited to contact us at 304-472-1651 for the 
GoToMeeting link/access. 
 

CITY COUNCIL OF BUCKHANNON – 7:00 PM IN THE COUNCIL CHAMBERS OF CITY HALL 
MEETING AGENDA FOR THURSDAY, JUNE 16, 2022 

A.      Call to Order 
           A.1   Moment of Silence 
           A.2   Pledge to the Flag of the United States of America 
 
B.      Recognized Guests 
           B.1   Pete Thackston, USI Insurance Services  
           B.2   Michael Mills, AIA, NCARB-Managing Principal, Mills Group, LLC 
           B.3   Dennis Cortes-Upshur County Parks & Recreation Board   
        
C.     Department & Board Reports 
          C.1   Public Works Director- Jerry Arnold  
          C.2   Finance Director- Amberle Jenkins   
          C.3   Police Chief- Matthew Gregory  
          C.4   City Attorney- Tom O’Neill  
 
D.     Correspondence & Information     
          D.1   Proclamation-Marvin and Sarah Carr Day-Upshur Parish House 30 Year Celebration 
          D.2   ARPA Project Updates & Miscellaneous with Potesta & Associates, Inc. 
          D.3   Deed & M.O.U. Roman Catholic Bishop of the Diocese of Wheeling RE: Property Exchange at bottom of Amalia 
                   Drive   
          D.4   Leadership Upshur Program-Accepting Applications due August 1, 2022. Apply at LeadershipUpshur.com 
          D.5   Buckhannon-Upshur Airport Authority Treasurer’s Report May-June 2022 
 
E.     Consent Agenda  
          E.1   Approval of Minutes –Regular Meeting 06/02/2022 
          E.2   Approval of Building and Wiring Permits 
          E.3   Approval of Payment of the Bills 
                                        
F.      Strategic Issues for Discussion and/or Vote 
          F.1   Approval Mayor’s Authority to Execute USI WV Public Employees Insurance Agency Consulting Agreement 2022 
          F.2   Mills Group, LLC Presentation of the Stockert Youth & Community Multi-Use Facility Project 
          F.3   Police Civil Service Commission Recommendation of Top 3 Candidates to Council for Consideration of Hiring & 
                   to set Date of Interviews for Position of Probationary Police Officer   
          F.4   B-U Youth Council Request Sponsorship of $475.00 for a Movie Show at the Youth-led Festival Friday on 
                   07/29/22 
          F.6   Approval Ordinance No. 458 Concerning Membership of Water Board & Waste Collection Boards 2nd/Final 
          F.5   Approval Ordinance No. 459 State Building Code Adoption 1st Reading      
         
G.      Comments and Announcements 
          G.1   Pamela Bucklew 
          G.2   C J Rylands  
          G.3   David Thomas 
          G.4   Jack Reger 
          G.5   Shelia Lewis-Sines 
          G.6   Randall Sanders 
 
H.     Mayor’s Comments and Announcements  



 
I.      Adjournment 
 
Posted 06/13/2022             Next Regular Scheduled City Council Meeting Thursday, July 7, 2022 
 

A. Call to Order - Mayor Robbie Skinner called the regular meeting of the Buckhannon City Council 
for June 16, 2022 to order and asked all to join him in the Moment of Silence and then led those in 
attendance in the Pledge. 
 
City Recorder Sanders asked to be recognized with Mayor Skinner doing so. Sanders noted that 
both Mayor Skinner and Councilman Reger were celebrating birthdays today.  He led those in 
Chambers in a congratulatory round of applause. 
 
Mayor Skinner also recognized that Upshur County’s Chief Deputy Mike Coffman had been shot in 
the line of duty while assisting the Lewis County Sherriff’s Department with an active shooter 
incident on I-79 earlier in the day.  The mayor reported that the Chief Deputy was out of surgery 
and recovering well.  He asked that we keep him and his family in our thoughts and prayers.    
 
B.  Recognized Guests – Mayor Skinner acknowledged that we had several guests on the agenda to 
address Council.  For those who will be discussing an issue that is already under the Issues for 
Discussion and/or Vote part of the agenda, he will use the Chairs Prerogative to bring that item to 
the table while the guest is recognized.  
 
B.1 Pete Thackston, USI Insurance Services – Mayor Skinner introduced Mr. Thackston who 
joined us though GoToMeeting.  The mayor also moved F.1 Approval Mayor’s Authority to Execute 
USI WV Public Employees Insurance Agency Consulting Agreement 2022 to the table for discussion 
and/or vote. 
 
Mr. Thackston provided an overview of the current state legislative considerations of the increase 
of claims against the PEIA insurance that will be affecting the future rates of the insurance noting 
the normal rate increase of 12% will be most likely be adjusted with an additional 2 ¾ % to 3% 
each year for 3 years beginning with the renewals for July of 2023. 
 
Mayor Skinner explained the agreement that the City has with USI Insurance Services is for $20,000 
per year, which includes Mr. Thackston meeting with the city’s employees on a regular basis to 
handle all insurance concerns. Agreement on file at City Hall, indexed as City A333. 
 
Motion to provide the Mayor the authority to execute the USI WV Public Employees 
Insurance Agency Consulting Agreement for 2022 was made by Rylands/Thomas.  Motion 
carried.  
 
B.2 Michael Mills, AIA, NCARB-Managing Principal, Mills Group, LLC – Prior to recognizing Mr. 
Mills, Mayor Skinner noted the featured article about Buckhannon in WV Living, whose editor and  
publisher is Mr. Mills’ wife, Nikki Bowman Mills. 



 

 

 



Mr. Mills then presented architectural drawings, photos and a video showcasing the final designs 
for the proposed Stockert Youth & Community Center’s new building.  He then entertained 
questions from the Board and attendees of the meeting. 

 

 

 

 



 
 
Council member Rylands advocated for the council to take the design elements to different 
organizations in the community for input and discussion before signing off on the final design.  He 
also mentioned upgrading the old building to better match the new facilities.  A lengthy discussion 
took place on how best to obtain options for the public’s input.  Council also heard from Don Nestor, 
a member of the SYCC’s Board of Directors, who explained the good things going on at SYCC and the 
input to the design that has been provided by the SYCC Board of Directors and urged the council 
move sooner than later on the project as a delay would mean more in anticipated building costs.  
After much discussion, it was determined to check on the stability of the current rates with the 
USDA and set up meeting with community organizations to present the plans and ask for input. 
 

B.3 Dennis Cortes-Upshur County Parks & Recreation Board–Dennis Cortes was not present 
but his report for the Upshur County Parks & Recreation Board is part of the meeting packet. 

REPORT FROM THE UPSHUR COUNTY PARKS & RECREATION ADVISORY BOARD 

FOR 24 MAY 2022 

 President Hinchman called the meeting to order at 5:35 PM. The minutes were approved and the financial 
report was made part of the record.  

Upshur County Trails Update: 

It was reported that the Upshur County Trails Group received the Upshur County Chamber of Commerce 
“Organization of the Year” award.  

The “Ruins” Trail is being completed. There was a trail work day on Saturday 21 May 2022 to build bridges 
on that section of trail. There are still more bridges to be completed.  

Director McCourt reported trail blazes have been ordered for the new trail segments.  

On 02 July 2022 the group will host another trail work day for the middle school and high school cross 
country teams.  

Rachel Weber reported that trail signs have gone missing as well as some disc golf signs.  

The group is finishing the “Try This West Virginia Grant” projects, which will map the trail for the purpose 
of getting a map printed.  

Fairy Garden: 

Saturday 04 June 2022 has been scheduled as a day for decorating the garden.  

Director’s Report: 

On 17 May 2022 there was a Wellness Day for 900 elementary school students. They conducted a short 
hike, fitness workout, track meet, archery, mental and emotional wellness, farm-to-table, first responders 
and also met with a representative from the WV State Attorney General’s office.  

On that same day Stockmeier Urethanes did an inspection of the tennis courts. 

The pool is now in use and there have been a few pool parties. Director McCourt reported that he was 
meeting with the life guards and concession workers.  

The cabinet for tool storage is in but needs to be put together. There still needs to be a new deadbolt 
installed on the door to the pavilion and the gate into the park is wired but needs a new outlet.  

The Hodgesville 4H Club is going to do a “cleanup day” and build the “Gaga” pit at the Pringle Tree Park.  

The Upshur County Recreational Complex Board approved $500.00 to resurface the basketball courts. The 
total cost will be $1,600.00.  

Disc Golf Tournament: 

These folks have raised $500.00 from sponsors and have had a trophy made. The tournament is scheduled 
for Saturday 28 May 2022, weather permitting. The discs will be purchased to rent out for public use.  

Public Comment: 

 The park entrance sign has been ordered. 

Respectfully submitted by Dennis P. Cortes   



 
C.     Department & Board Reports 
 
C.1 Public Works Director - Jerry Arnold – Mr. Arnold was recognized by Mayor Skinner and 
presented the following report: 
 
The generator for the Safety Complex delivery date has been extended to January 20, 2023. 
 
The City has received approval for the $213,000 Transportation Enhancement Grant to complete 
the Gateway West project. 
 
There will be approximately 230 address that have to be changed affecting 15 Streets and a total 
1,700 addresses.  We are obtaining procedural assistance from Upshur County.  Mr. Arnold 
recommends that we follow the County address system to provide continuity for our first 
responders and the delivery of mail. 
 
Mayor Skinner noted that this address change requirement is required by the national USPS.  He 
strongly recommends that we use the Upshur County 911 address system as we implement. 

 



 

 

 



 
C.2 Finance Director - Amberle Jenkins – Mayor Skinner recognized Amberle Jenkins, who 
provided the following report: 
 

 
 
C.3 Police Chief- Matthew Kimble - Mayor Skinner recognized Buckhannon Police Chief Matthew 
Gregory who presented the following report to City Council: 
 

 

 



 

 

  



 

 

 
C.4 City Attorney- Tom O’Neill – Mr. O’Neill did not have a formal presentation. 
 
D. Correspondence & Information – The Mayor reviewed the following with Council: 
 
D.1   Proclamation-Marvin and Sarah Carr Day-Upshur Parish House 30 Year Celebration 

 

PROCLAMATION 
 
WHEREAS  Marvin H. Carr, III, and Sarah Lynch Carr have resided in Buckhannon, West Virginia, as 
active, model citizens since 1974; and  
 
WHEREAS  Marvin and Sarah responded to the crises of the Flood of 1985 and the closing of several area 
coal mines shortly thereafter through the creation of the Upshur Parish House; and 
 
WHEREAS  Marvin and Sarah collaborated with other local leaders to establish the Upshur Parish House 
in 1992 as a place of ministry for the Upshur Cooperative Parish of the West Virginia Conference of The 
United Methodist Church; and  
 
WHEREAS  Sarah has served the community as an advocate for early childhood education, as an 
educator herself, as a Church and Community Worker, as a Deaconess, and as the first Director of the 
Upshur Parish House; and 
 
WHEREAS  Marvin has served as coordinator of the Upshur Parish of United Methodist Churches for 
nearly 50 years; and  
 
WHEREAS  Marvin and Sarah have maintained a commitment to ecumenical ministry with and for all of 
our Upshur County neighbors; and 
 
WHEREAS  Marvin and Sarah nurtured, mentored, and shepherded hundreds of college and ministerial 
students in Christian education, outreach ministry, Appalachian studies, and local and state history; and  
 
WHEREAS  the Upshur Parish House, located in the town of Buckhannon and county of Upshur, now 
celebrates 30 years of ministry and mission work, and continues to flourish as an anchor of the 



community serving our neighbors-in-need due to the solid foundation provided by Marvin and Sarah’s 
leadership; and 
 
WHEREAS  Marvin and Sarah have lived out their faith by freely and generously offering love, grace, 
compassion, and kindness to all. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, I, Robert N. Skinner, III, Mayor of the City of Buckhannon, West Virginia, do 
hereby proclaim June 9, 2022, to be  
 

MARVIN AND SARAH CARR DAY 
 
The City of Buckhannon commends Marvin and Sarah, as well as the staff and volunteers of the Upshur 
Parish House, for their dedication to loving their neighbors in all aspects of mission, ministry and service 
for more than 30 years. 
 

Given under my hand and official seal of 
The City of Buckhannon, this 9th day of June, 2022 

 
Robert N. Skinner, III, Mayor 

 
D.2   ARPA Project Updates & Miscellaneous with Potesta & Associates, Inc. 

 

 



 

 

 

D.3   Deed & M.O.U. Roman Catholic Bishop of the Diocese of Wheeling RE: Property Exchange 
at bottom of Amalia Drive   

 



 

 

 



 

 

 

D.4   Leadership Upshur Program-Accepting Applications due August 1, 2022. Apply at 
LeadershipUpshur.com 
D.5   Buckhannon-Upshur Airport Authority Treasurer’s Report May-June 2022 



 
 

 
 
 
E.  Consent Agenda –Mayor Skinner asked for approval of the following items: 
E.1   Approval of Minutes –Regular Meeting 06/02/2022 
E.2   Approval of Building and Wiring Permits 
 
 
 
 



                      #75536-#75555 Permit Fee Report 
 

 

06/02/2022 - 06/15/2022 
 

Perm
it # 

Applican
t Name 

Applicant 
Address 

Primary 
Contractor 

Descripti
on 

Project 
Cost 

Fee 
Amoun

t 

Electric
al 

Propert
y Type 

Asbesto
s 

Inspecti
on 

Zoning 
Approv
al Date 

Histori
c 

Proper
ty 

Floo
d 

Zon
e 

Are
a 

Flood 
Zone 

/Elevati
on 

Certifica
te 

FEMA 
Accesso
ry Use 

Group: Commercial-Industrial (nonresidential) 

75554 PATRICK 
MARTIN 
RENTALS 

166 
POCAHONT
AS ST  

 REROOF 
(SHINGLE 
OVER 
SHINGLE)
& 
BATHROO
M 
REMODEL 

6,500.00 61.75  No  No  No No 

75549 Dave 
Long 

25 W Main 
St 

SITE WORKS 
LLC 

Remove 
Concrete 
and 
Replace 
with 
Gravel in 
rear 
parking 
area 

2,000.00 19.00    Yes   No  

     8,500.00 80.75        

Group Total: 2 

Group: Demolition 

75552 Tom 
Gillespie 

112 
Pocahontas 
St 

 Razing 
Shed 

0.00 20.00  Yes -If 
yes 
attach 
report 

 No  No  

     0.00 20.00        

Group Total: 1 

Group: Residential (non-commercial) 

75555 Bonnie 
Rogers 

63 
Smithfield 
St 

BURKHOLDER 
ENTERPRISE 

Re-Roof 
Metal over 
Shingle 

10,000.00 110.00    Yes   No  

75553 Chelsea 
Lambert 

13 Kepner PATACHES 
REPAIRS & 
INSTALL 
LLOC 

Deck 
24'x12' 

13,000.00 143.00   6/13/20
22 

No  No  

75551 BETTY 
ROLLINS 

130 
FAYETTE 
ST  

WARE'S 
BUILDING 
CONSTRUCTI
ON, LLC 

RE-ROOF 
SHINGLES 

9,162.36 100.79  Yes -If 
yes 
attach 
report 

 No  No No 

75550 Cristobal 
Cruz 

123 
Railraod 
Ave 

 Replace 
leaking 
ceiling in 
bedroom 

2,450.00 26.95    No Zone 
AE 

Yes- 
Elevation 
Cert. Not 
Required 

 

75548 Megan 
Talbott 

9 1/2 Park 
St 

Terranos 
Concrete 
Finishing Co 

Repair 
section of 
Roof 
replace w/ 
Metal-Not 
removing 
materials, 
Remodel 
Kitchen, 
Bathroom, 
Flooring & 
Replace 
Inside 
Repair 

30,000.00 270.00  No  No  No  

75546 Hannah 
Thome 

84 W 
Lincoln St 

WINDOW 
WORLD OF 
FAIRMONT 

Replacem
ent 12 
Windows 

6,275.00 69.03    No  No  

75547 Sarah 
Critchfield 

10 Cooper 
St 

DOUBLE A 
CONSTRUCTI
ON 

Metal 
Roofing 
over 
Shingle- 
Not 
removing 
materials 

4,000.00 44.00    No Zone 
AE 

Yes- 
Elevation 
Cert. Not 
Required 

 

75545 EDITH 
BENDER 

215 
CAMDEN 
AVE 

PANHANDLE 
CLEANING 

REMOVE 
AND 
REPLACE 
KITCHEN 
CABINETS
, SUB 

11,953.73 131.50        



FLOOR, 
AND 
HARDWO
OD 
FLOORING 

75540 Ella 
Mackey 

48 
Thurman 
Ave 

 vinyl 
siding on 
garage 
uses as a 
storage 
building 

1,500.00 16.50    No Zone 
AE 

Yes- 
Elevation 
Cert. Not 
Required 

 

75541 Mike 
Knabensh
ue 

150 
Pocahontas 
St 

 replace 
deck 
boards 
flooring 

4,500.00 49.50    No  No  

75542 JULIA 
KASTNER 

144 S 
FLORIDA 
ST  

BROKEN 
RIDGE 
SERVICES, 
LLC 

6' VINYL 
FENCE  

2,499.00 27.50   6/3/202
2 

No  No  

75543 NATE 
KENNEDY 

36 
CENTRAL 
AVE 

 NEW 
WOOD 
SIDING 
AND 
INSECT 
REPAIR 

999.00 10.00    Yes     

75544 CRISTOB
AL 
EVARIST
O & 
ARELY 
CRUZ 

123 
RAILROAD 
AVE  

 REPLACIN
G PORCH 
22' X 8' 

2,200.00 24.20   6/3/202
2 

No Zone 
AE 

Yes- 
Elevation 
Cert. Not 
Required 

 

75536 Rodney 
Kennedy 

39 N 
Florida St 

 Replacem
ent Vinyl 
Siding 

4,000.00 44.00    No Zone 
AE 

Yes -If 
yes 
attach 
report 

 

75537 Tyler 
Waldo 

175 
Pocahontas 
St 

RELIABLE 
ROOFING & 
SHEET METAL 

Re-Roof 
Shingles 

10,000.00 110.00  Yes -If 
yes 
attach 
report 

 No  No  

75538 Dominick 
Debais 

43 
Sedgwick 
St 

RELIABLE 
ROOFING & 
SHEET METAL 

Re-Roof 
Shingles 

10,142.44 111.57  Yes -If 
yes 
attach 
report 

 Yes   No  

     122,681.
53 

1,288.
54 

       

Group Total: 16 

Group: Zoning Application Fee 

75553 Chelsea 
Lambert 

13 Kepner PATACHES 
REPAIRS & 
INSTALL 
LLOC 

Deck 
24'x12' 

13,000.00 20.00   6/13/20
22 

No  No  

75544 CRISTOB
AL 
EVARIST
O & 
ARELY 
CRUZ 

123 
RAILROAD 
AVE  

 REPLACIN
G PORCH 
22' X 8' 

2,200.00 20.00   6/3/202
2 

No Zone 
AE 

Yes- 
Elevation 
Cert. Not 
Required 

 

75542 JULIA 
KASTNER 

144 S 
FLORIDA 
ST  

BROKEN 
RIDGE 
SERVICES, 
LLC 

6' VINYL 
FENCE  

2,499.00 20.00   6/3/202
2 

No  No  

     17,699.0
0 

60.00        

Group Total: 3 

     148,880.
53 

1,449.
29 

       

 

 

Total Records: 22 6/16/2022 
 

 
 
E.3   Approval of Payment of the Bills 

 



 
 

 



 
 

 



 

 



 

 
Motion to approve the Consent Agenda as presented was made by Lewis-Sines/Reger.  
Motion carried. 
 
 
F. Strategic Issues for Discussion and/or Vote 
  
F.1   Approval Mayor’s Authority to Execute USI WV Public Employees Insurance Agency 
Consulting Agreement 2022 – Action taken earlier in the meeting. 
 
F.2   Mills Group, LLC Presentation of the Stockert Youth & Community Multi-Use Facility 
Project – Presentation took place; no action was necessary.  
 



F.3   Police Civil Service Commission Recommendation of Top 3 Candidates to Council for 
Consideration of Hiring & to set Date of Interviews for Position of Probationary Police 
Officer – Discussion took place. 
 
June 10, 2022 

Mayor and City Council Members, 

Re: Approval of candidates per the Police Civil Service Commission to interview for probationary police 

officer: 

A Police Civil Service Commission meeting was held on June 10, 2022 to update and certify the current list of 

eligibles for submittal of three (3) candidates to City Council for hiring consideration. City Council has 

authorized identification of the top three candidates to arrange for the interviews and make a hiring decision. 

Upon completion of the Buckhannon Police Civil Service Commission requirements, we are pleased to 

advance and certify the following candidates for your consideration as probationary Buckhannon Police 

Officers; 

 

1. Jason Grady Fitzgerald  82.97% 

2. Dylan Ray Major   79.05% 

3. Johnathan Levi Tomey  78.14% 

 

Commissioner   Sean Harris      
Commissioner       Geraldine Henderson                                                                                    
Commissioner        Mark Spencer                              
City Recorder   Randall Sanders  

 
 
 
Motion to accept the Police Civil Service Commission Recommendation of Top 3 Candidates 
being Jason Grady Fitzgerald, Dylan Ray Major, and Johnathan Levi Tomey for Consideration 
of Hiring was made by Sanders/Bucklew.  Motion carried. 
 
Motion to hold the Interviews for Position of Probationary Police Officer July 12, 2022 at 
1:30 PM in Council Chambers was made by Reger/Thomas.  Motion carried. 
 
F.4   B-U Youth Council Request Sponsorship of $475.00 for a Movie Show at the Youth-led 
Festival Friday on 07/29/22 – Discussion took place regarding the request. 
 
Motion to approve the B-U Youth Council request for sponsorship of $475.00 for a Movie 
Show at the Youth-led Festival Friday on 07/29/22 was made by Rylands/Sanders.  Motion 
carried.   
 
Mr. Sanders recommend that beginning with the new fiscal year of July 1, 2022 we review the 
procedure in which organizations ask for contributions from Council.  The Mayor agreed to look at 
new procedures to present to consideration. 
 
F.6   Approval Ordinance No. 458 Concerning Membership of Water Board & Waste 
Collection Boards 2nd/Final Reading – Mayor Skinner recognized City Attorney Tom O’Neil who 
presented Ordinance No. 458 to the Council members and offered to answer any questions.  There 
were no questions. 
 
Motion to approve Ordinance No. 458 concerning membership of Water Board & Waste 
Collection Boards on its 2nd and final reading was made by Thomas/Reger.  Motion carried. 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 458 OF THE CITY OF BUCKHANNON, AN ORDINANCE AMENDING, IN PART, 
ORDINANCE NOS. 117 AND 126 OF THE CITY OF BUCKHANNON, MODIFYING THE 

QUALIFICATIONS FOR MEMBERS OF THE CITY’S WATER BOARD AND WASTE COLLECTION 
BOARD 

 



 WHEREAS, in Ordinance No. 126, the City of Buckhannon established its Water Board to 

administer the City’s drinking water utility operations; and, 

 WHEREAS, in Ordinance No. 117, the City established its Waste Collection Board to administer 

the solid waste collection and disposal operations it offers to its customers within and outside of the 

municipal limits; and, 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to West Virginia Code §8-19-19 and §8-16-4, the City has wide latitude in 

setting the qualifications for members of those respective boards; and, 

 WHEREAS, upon due consideration, the Council of the City of Buckhannon has determined that it 

is in the best interest of those respective boards to modify the qualifications for membership on said boards, 

to provide for and allow the possibility of the appointment of board members who live outside of the 

municipal limits in certain cases; and, 

 WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Buckhannon desires in all respects to comply with the statutes 

of the State of West Virginia and further with the administrative rules and regulations of the Public Service 

Commission of West Virginia insofar as the establishment and administration of its several utility operations 

is concerned. 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

BUCKHANNON, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

 ARTICLE I – AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 126: QUALIFICATIONS FOR MEMBERS OF THE 

BUCKHANNON WATER BOARD: 

 Ordinance No. 126 of the City of Buckhannon is amended to provide as follows: 

a) The Water Board of the City of Buckhannon shall consist of five (5) members. One of the members 

shall be, ex officio, the Mayor of the City of Buckhannon, who shall be Chairman or Chairwoman of the 

Board; two of the members shall be members of the Council City of Buckhannon, ex officio, designated by 

the Council; two of the members shall be residents of Upshur County, West Virginia, who reside within the 

direct retail service area of the City of Buckhannon Water Board. Members of the Water Board serving ex 

officio shall have all the privileges and powers of membership during their term or terms, including the ability 

to vote on matters before the board. For purposes of clarity, the “direct retail service area” of the City of 

Buckhannon Water Board excludes the service area of any entity, association, company, or Public Service 

District which purchases water on a wholesale basis from the City of Buckhannon Water Board. 

b) The term of each member of the Water Board, excepting the Mayor, expires on June 30, annually, 

or at such time thereafter as their successors are named and qualified. 

c) All other terms and provisions of the said Ordinance No. 126 not expressly modified hereby remain 

in full force and effect. 

 

 ARTICLE II - AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 117: QUALIFICATIONS FOR MEMBERS OF THE 

BUCKHANNON WASTE COLLECTION BOARD:   

 Ordinance No. 117 of the City of Buckhannon is amended to provide as follows: 

a) The Waste Removal Board of the City of Buckhannon shall consist of three (3) members. One of 

the members shall be, ex officio, the Mayor of the City of Buckhannon, who shall be Chairman or 

Chairwoman of the Board; two of the members shall be residents of Upshur County, West Virginia, who 

reside within service area of the City of Buckhannon Waste Collection Board. Members of the Water Board 

serving ex officio shall have all the privileges and powers of membership during their term or terms, 

including the ability to vote on matters before the board. 

b) The term of each member of the Water Board, excepting the Mayor, expires on June 30, annually, 

or at such time thereafter as their successors are named and qualified. 

c) All other terms and provisions of the said Ordinance No. 117 not expressly modified hereby remain 

in full force and effect. 

 ARTICLE III - SEVERABILITY:  In the event that any provision(s) of this Ordinance is determined 

to be unconstitutional or invalid by a court exercising competent jurisdiction, such determination shall not 



affect the validity of this Ordinance as a whole or the provisions thereof which are not specifically held to 

be unconstitutional or invalid other than that provision(s) which is specifically determined to be 

unconstitutional or invalid. 

 ARTICLE IV - EFFECTIVE DATE:  This Ordinance shall be deemed effective immediately following 

thirty (30) days from the second (2nd) reading, passage and adoption by the Council of the City of 

Buckhannon, i.e., July 16, 2022. 

 

 FIRST READING:  June 2, 2022 

 SECOND READING, PASSAGE, AND ADOPTION:  June 16, 2022 

 

Robert N. Skinner, III, Mayor 

 

CERTIFICATE OF ENACTMENT 

 

 I, Randall H. Sanders, City Recorder, do hereby certify that the foregoing Ordinance No. 458 was 

lawfully ordained and enacted by the Council of the City of Buckhannon at a regular session of the said 

Council assembled on June 16, 2022. 

 
 

Randall H. Sanders, City Recorder 
 
 
F.5   Approval Ordinance No. 459 State Building Code Adoption 1st Reading - City Attorney 
Tom O’Neil who presented Ordinance No. 459 to the Council members and offered to answer any 
questions.  There were no questions. 
 
Motion to approve Ordinance No. 459 concerning the State Building Code adoption on its 1st 
reading was made by Sanders/Reger.  Motion carried. 

ORDINANCE NO. 459 OF THE CITY OF BUCKHANNON, AN ORDINANCE 
AMENDING PRIOR ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF BUCKHANNON 

BY PROVIDING FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE WEST VIRGINIA STATE BUILDING CODE SET FORTH 
AND DEFINED BY TITLE 87, SERIES 4 OF  

THE CODE OF STATE RULES, AS AMENDED; AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY 

 
 WHEREAS, West Virginia Code §8-12-13 empowers municipalities to adopt building codes, but 

requires that any code adopted be the state building code as promulgated by the state fire commission; 

and, 

 WHEREAS, the City of Buckhannon has one year from the promulgation of said state building code 

in which to adopt the same; and, 

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Buckhannon passed and adopted Ordinance No. 377, being 

the City of Buckhannon’s Electrical Inspection and Fire Protection Ordinance, on September 19, 2013, 

effective on October 19, 2013; and, 

 WHEREAS, the said Ordinance No. 377 was amended in certain respects by the provisions of 

Ordinance No. 378, including the imposition of a fee structure, effective February 1, 2014; and,  

 WHEREAS, Ordinance No. 398, effective January 16, 2016 placed into effect the 2015 edition of 

the International Property Maintenance Code, making certain amendments thereto and establishing further 

fee structures; and 

 WHEREAS, Ordinance No. 417, effective June 2, 2017, placed into effect the 2015 State Building 

Code, as demised therein; and 

 WHEREAS, Ordinance No. 436, effective April 18, 2019, placed into effect the International 

Building Code 2015 (with amendments), and other codes; and 

 WHEREAS, Ordinance No. 446, effective August 20, 2020, placed into effect the NFPA Life Safety 

Code 2018 edition and the 2017 edition of the National Electric Code, NFPA 70; and 

 WHEREAS, the State Fire Commission, pursuant to Legislative Rules promulgated by the Fire 

Marshal under West Virginia Code §29-3-5b, dated May 5, 2022, made certain changes to Title 87 – Series 



4 effect August 1, 2022, and this Ordinance is adopted in order to provide for municipal adoption and 

enforcement of those same codes; and, 

 WHEREAS, the Office of the State Fire Marshall has adopted further updates to national standards 

and codes for commercial buildings; and, 

 WHEREAS, the City of Buckhannon was made aware of these updated by letter dated June 1, 

2022, and this Ordinance is presented to the Council of the City of Buckhannon for its consideration at the 

first opportunity since receiving said notice; and, 

 WHEREAS, the Officer of the State Fire Marshall has required updated ordinances to be adopted 

and effective on or before August 1, 2022, otherwise “all building codes previously adopted by local 

jurisdictions are null and void”, but receipt of this notice was not received with sufficient time for a regular 

ordinance to become effective under the required timeframe; and, 

 WHEREAS, public health and public safety require the uninterrupted effectiveness of the building 

codes adopted by the City, thus necessitating the declaration of an emergency under Section 16 of the 

Charter of the City of Buckhannon; and, 

 WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Buckhannon desires in all respects to comply with the statutes 

of the State of West Virginia insofar as matters concerning building codes, and wishes to remain under the 

existing State Building Code.  

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

BUCKHANNON, AS FOLLOWS: 

 ARTICLE I - ADOPTION:  The Council of the City of Buckhannon hereby amends and reenacts 

Ordinance Nos. 378, 398, 417, 436, 446, or any other ordinances previously adopted concerning building 

codes, by adopting and incorporating by reference, as if set out at length herein, for the purposes of 

safeguarding life and property and to ensure the quality of construction of all structures erected, renovated, 

or removed throughout the City, that certain code known as the State Building Code, set forth and defined 

by Legislative Rule Title 87, Series 4 of the West Virginia Code of State Rules, as amended, as promulgated 

by the West Virginia State Fire Marshal pursuant to authority granted in West Virginia Code § 29-3-5b. 

 The standards and requirements as set out and published by the International Code Council, and 

American National Standards Institute, and the National Fire Protection Association, as listed below, and 

as adopted by the State Fire Commission with an effective date of August 1, 2022, shall have the same 

force and effect as if set out verbatim herein: 

a. The 2018 edition, International Building Code, as amended by section 4.1.a of 87 CSR 4; 

b. The 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code; 

c. The 2018 edition of the International Mechanical Code, as modified by section 4.1.c of 87 

CSR 4; 

d. The 2018 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, as modified by section 4.1.d of 87 

CSR 4; 

e. The 2018 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code 

f. The 2015 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code, as modified by section 

4.1.f of 87 CSR 4; 

g. The ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA (as defined in 87 CSR 4) Standard 90.1 2013 edition for 

commercial buildings; 

h. The 2018 edition of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family 

Dwellings, as modified by section 4.1.h of 87 CSR 4; 

i. Section R311.7.5 Stair Treads and Risers 

j. [Reserved] 

k. [Reserved] 

l. The 2017 ICC/ANSI (as defined in 87 CSR 4) A117.1 American National Standards for 

Accessibility & Usable Buildings & Facilities 



m. The 2018 International Existing Building Code, as modified by section 4.1.l.2 of 87 CSR 

4; 

n. The 2020 edition of the National Electrical Code, NFPA 70, as modified by section 4.1.m 

of 87 CSR 4; 

o. The 2018 edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code; and 

p. Any other codes adopted, as amended or modified, in 87 CSR 4. 

 

Wherever referenced in the several ICC codes adopted in this Ordinance or in 87 CSR 4, any 

reference to the International Fire Code should be substituted with the NFPA Life Safety Code 2021 edition. 

 

 ARTICLE II – SEVERABILITY:  In the event that any provision of this Ordinance is determined to 

be unconstitutional or otherwise invalid by a court exercising competent jurisdiction, such determination 

shall not affect the validity of this Ordinance as a whole or the provisions thereof which are not specifically 

determined to be unconstitutional or invalid. 

 

 ARTICLE III – EFFECT UPON CITY ORDINANCE NOS. 378, 398, 417, 436, 446 AND ANY AND 

ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF BUCKHANNON PREVIOUSLY ENACTED RESPECTING 

INSPECTIONS, PERMITS OR FEES:  The provisions of Ordinance Nos. 378, 398, 417, 436, 446 and any 

and all other Ordinances of the City of Buckhannon previously adopted are hereby amended only to the 

extent of the provisions of this Ordinance; however, all provisions of previously adopted City ordinances, 

particularly Ordinance Nos. 378, 398, 417, 436, and 446 of the City of Buckhannon, that are not expressly 

amended by this Ordinance, including their imposition of requirements for inspections, permits, and fees 

payable to the City, shall remain in full force and legal effect. 

 

 ARTICLE IV – DECLARATION OF EMERGENCY AND EFFECTIVE DATE:  Pursuant to Section 

16 of the Charter of the City of Buckhannon, the City Council does unanimously declare that public health 

and public safety demand the declaration of an emergency in the adoption of this ordinance, and that an 

emergency is hereby declared. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force immediately upon its 

passage by the Council of the City of Buckhannon on July 7, 2022. 

 

 FIRST READING:   June 16, 2022 

 SECOND READING, PASSAGE AND ADOPTION:   July 7, 2022 

 

Robert N. Skinner, III, Mayor 

 

 

CERTIFICATE OF ENACTMENT 

 I, Randall H. Sanders, City Recorder, do hereby certify that the foregoing Ordinance No. 459 was 

lawfully, and unanimously, ordained and enacted by the Council of the City of Buckhannon at a regular 

session of the said Council assembled on July 7, 2022. 

 

Randall H. Sanders, City Recorder 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



G.      Comments and Announcements 
 

 Council Member Bucklew – Mrs. Bucklew noted that she is excited about the new building 
concept for the Stockert Youth & Community Center and hopes the project moves forward 
within the next 4 to 6 months.  She invited anyone interested in contacting her to talk about 
the design. 
 

 Council Member Rylands – Mr. Rylands stated that he too was hopeful that the Stockert 
Youth & Community Center project moves forward and breaks ground by the end of the 
year; but he would like to have as much community input as possible before settling on a 
final design. 
 

● Council Member Reger – Mr. Reger noted that the forthcoming insurance rate increases 
we discussed were expected.  He did ask what the e-mod (experience modifier) rating for 
Buckhannon was and Mayor Skinner noted it is below 1.0%.  

● Council Member Thomas – Mr. Thomas wished both Mayor Skinner and council member 
Reger a Happy Birthday.  He noted the discussion about the Stockert Youth & Community 
Center was very positive.  He also stated that he was concerned with the dangerous 
activities happening in our world.  He feels that we should consider a joint meeting with the 
County and the City law enforcement community to see what we can do to control it in our 
area.  He thanked Sheila Lewis-Sines for her service to the City as a council member and 
wished her well.    

● City Recorder Sanders – Mr. Sanders thanked Sheila Lewis-Sines as well for her work as a 
council member and wished her well.  He also provided an update on the planning for the 
WAMSB event in 2023 and a report on the Miss West Virginia USA/Teen USA pageants that 
were recently held in Buckhannon at West Virginia Wesleyan College, thanking all those 
who provided support. 
 

● Mayor Skinner took a moment to remind everyone that Buckhannon would be sponsoring 
the Fireworks celebration this year in conjunction with Create Buckhannon’s Festival Friday 
event on Friday, July 1, 2022.  
 
He then recognized outgoing council member Shelia Lewis-Sines for her final remarks. 

● Council Member Sines – Mrs. Lewis-Sines expressed gratitude for the opportunity to serve 
on City Council and for the efforts put forth by all council members.  She encouraged others 
to become involved and urged all to never allow themselves to be bullied.      

H.  Mayor’s Comments and Announcements – Mayor Skinner called for a brief Executive Session 
to discuss a personnel matter per WV State Code §6-9A-4. 
 
Motion to adjoin into Executive Session to discuss personnel matters at 8:39 PM was made 
by Sanders/Rylands.  Motion carried. 
 
Motion to exit Executive Session at 9:14 PM was made by Rylands/Thomas.  Motion carried. 
 
Mayor Skinner noted that personnel matters were discussed with no decisions made while in the 
Executive Session.  
   

I.  Adjournment  
 
Motion to adjourn at 9:15 PM was made by Sanders/Thomas.  Motion carried. 
 
Mayor Robert N. Skinner III                                          ______________________________________________ 

 
City Recorder Randall H. Sanders                               ______________________________________________ 


